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Card Harriers Whip
Centreville, 3 Rivers
Coldwater High junior Scott

Gleason paced the Cardinal cross
country team to a pair of victories
Tuesday, 18-43 over Centreville and
27-29 over Three Rivers, in the Red-
birds’ opening meet of the year at
Memorial Park.

All-stater John Haigh of Three
Rivers took the early lead, but
Gleason caught him at the half-way
point. Haigh, who was not in good ear
ly season form, faded to seventh while
Gleason posted his personal best time
of 16 minutes, 37.8 seconds for first.
Seth Brown of Three Rivers took se

cond at 17:28, while Cardinal senior
Mike Fadden ran a strong early
season race to grab third at 17:39.
Kevin Sussex of Coldwater placed
fifth and the Cards’ Brian Licht came
in ninth to clinch Coldwater’s two-
point win.
The girls had an easier time of it as

they downed Three Rivers 17-44 and

Centreville 18-45. The wins were the
first ever for the new girl’s cross
country program at Coldwater.
Veteran Marianne Exelby led the

Cards with a first-place time of
20:34.3. She was followed by
sophomore Dawn Valle in second
(21:47), Cynthia Grupp in fourth and
Shelly Thompson and Shelly Angle in
sixth and seventh, respectively.
Freshman Kristin Bell placed ninth,
Robin Brodt placed 10th and Kay
Nowak came in 12th to round out Col
dwater’s placers.
The Cards took seven of the first 10

places and all were better than 25
minutes. “The girls showed a great
deal of potential today,’’ Coach Jim
Bilsborrow remarked.
Both Coldwater teams will be in ac

tion again on Saturday when they
take part in the Centreville Invita
tional.


